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Military coups in Africa 
tend to attract inordinate 
attention, especially from 

the Western media and academia. 
The Western media is usually keen 
to report the dramatic and the sen-
sational that comes out of Africa. 
On its cover page of January 1984, 
Time Magazine summarised the 
continent in three words: ‘Coups, 
Conflict and Corruption’.1 On 
31 January 2023, the New York 
Times ran a headline: ‘Five African 
Countries. Six Coups. Why Now?’ 
(MacLean 2023). A similar story 
appeared in The Economist, on 
9 October 2023: ‘Where will the 
next coup be in Africa?’ In other 
words, for Western media, the coup 
is Africa’s bizarre normalcy.

It is bizarre because recent research 
shows that there is no particular re-
lationship between coup diffusion, 
the proliferation of coup-incentives 
and the triggering of coups d’état. 
It also seems that ‘democratic 
backsliding’ is not a sufficient 
coup-trigger. But there is an ob-
served correlation between pover-
ty, coup legacy, ongoing dilemmas 
of democratic consolidation and 
recent coups (Chin and Kirkpat-
rick 2023). There are as yet no suf-
ficient or compelling explanations 
for the recent upsurge in coups.

But we have been told that the 
‘coup-epidemic’ has returned to 
the continent with a big bang—a 
wave of military putsches across 
the Sahel and West Africa, starting 
particularly with the August 2020 
coup in Mali against President Ibra-

him Boubacar Keïta, then in 2021, 
coups in Chad, Mali (again), Guin-
ea Conakry and Sudan; in 2022 in 
Burkina Faso (twice in January and 
September); and in 2023 in Niger 
and Equatorial Guinea.

These coup incidents have led 
many to suggest that there is a 
return to the era of coups d’état, 
but that suggestion betrays a lack 
of historical perspective on the 
over-sized roles of the military 
and militarism in African politi-
cal processes writ large (Hutchful 
and Bathily 1998). The claim of a 
‘return of the coup’ in and of itself 
says little about the causes and trig-
gers of these putsches. It also says 
little about the fluctuations in coup 
incidents over time—decline, then 
return, then decline again.

For most of the 2010s, the count 
of successful coups trended down-
wards. The trend and trajectory ap-
peared to point towards an emerg-
ing ‘taboo’ of sorts against direct 
military takeovers on the conti-
nent.2 As Issaka Souaré persuasive-
ly argued in a 2014 article in the 
Journal of Modern African Stud-
ies, since the adoption of the Lomé 

Convention, a normative standard 
had taken root, with the African 
Union playing the role of a ‘norm 
entrepreneur’ (Souaré 2014).

Coups in Historical Context

Egypt registered Africa’s first mili-
tary coup d’état in 1952. Sudan fol-
lowed in 1958. Further south and 
across to West Africa, the bloody 
overthrow of President Sylva-
nus Olympio in Togo in 1963 be-
came the bookend to an unfolding 
wave. When the khaki men turned 
on President Kwame Nkrumah in 
Ghana in 1966, the reverberations 
rang louder across the continent 
and, indeed, around the world. Dr 
Nkrumah was not just the doyen of 
Africa’s struggle for liberation; he 
was the chief architect of a united 
continent. His regional and inter-
national reputation as the Pan-Af-
ricanist and continental liberator of 
the time did little to save him. His 
overthrow was a clear harbinger of 
what lay ahead for the continent.

By the end of the 1970s, there had 
been a staggering forty successful 
military coups. The historian Rich-
ard Reid has laconically noted a re-
volving-door regularity of soldiers 
overthrowing soldiers in Benin—
in just ten years, Benin had expe-
rienced five successful military 
coups (Reid 2012:154). At the end 
of the 1980s, most African states 
had experienced at least one suc-
cessful coup, with several repeat 
cases, notably Benin, Burkina Faso 
and Nigeria, tied at six apiece.
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After overthrowing civilian lead-
ers, uniformed men turned to over-
throwing each other in counter-
coups, palace coups and ‘coups 
of descending order’. In Burkina 
Faso, Ghana, Liberia and Sierra 
Leone, among others, senior offi-
cers who had overthrown civilian 
incumbents were themselves taken 
out by disgruntled junior officers.

One thing that emerged in this 
era of routine coups that is inter-
esting—and remains puzzling to 
students of civil–military rela-
tions—is that while some countries 
experienced recurring military 
coups d’état, others, like Ghana af-
ter Jerry Rawlings’s ‘second com-
ing’ in 1981 and Uganda after Tito 
Okello’s overthrow in 1986, did not 
follow the same course. During the 
1990s, some countries remained 
more coup-prone than others de-
spite the latter having a previous, 
similar predisposition to coups. 
There seems to be an unknown 
mechanism for cutting the cord 
that connects one coup d’état to 
the next. Understanding the ‘coup-
proofing’ strategies, therefore, re-
mains a relevant area of inquiry                                                        
(Rwengabo 2013).

The Ghanaian Experience

The overthrow of Dr Nkrumah in 
1966 introduced a coup-culture 
that dogged Ghana for a long time. 
After a brief return to civilian dem-
ocratic rule in 1969, President Kofi 
Busia was overthrown in 1972 by 
Colonel Ignatius Kutu Acheam-
pong, who in turn was overthrown 
in a 1978 palace coup by his depu-
ty, General Frederick Akuffo, only 
for General Akuffo, too, to be over-
thrown months later in a junior of-
ficer’s coup in June 1979!

The late 1970s and early 1980s 
were tempestuous times in Gha-
na. Flight Lieutenant Jerry John 
Rawlings and others mutinied 

in May 1979, were arrested and 
condemned to death for attempt-
ing to overthrow General Akuffo’s 
ruling junta, the Supreme Mili-
tary Council II. But as Rawlings 
awaited execution, a small group 
of junior officers daringly freed 
him; he then announced the over-
throw of General Akuffo and de-
clared a new government under 
the Armed Forces Revolutionary 
Council (AFRC). The AFRC then 
went on a rampage. It was called                              
‘house-cleaning’.

In what was arguably the most ex-
treme and chilling public act, the 
‘small boys’ running the show in 
Ghana against the ‘big men’, to 
use Paul Nugent’s words (1995), 
publicly executed half a dozen se-
nior army officers, including three 
former heads of state: generals 
Akuffo, Acheampong and Akwasi 
Afrifa. Afrifa had co-led the 1966 
coup against Dr Nkrumah. 

Allegedly, the ‘big men’ in the 
army and their civilian counter-
parts had visited so much wrong 
on the country through corruption, 
abuse of power and runaway mal-
feasance that there was a need for 
an operation of exorcism. The cor-
rupted sociopolitical environment 
that had eaten up Ghana went by 
the popular local word kalabule. 
The mantra of the moment, given 
moral currency and credibility by 
a controversial Catholic priest, the 
Rev Dr Kwabena Vincent Damuah, 
was ‘let the blood flow’. And                                                 
flow, it did.

For what it was worth, elections 
were held swiftly at the end of 1979 
and a new civilian president, Dr 
Hilla Limann, took over, only to be 
overthrown on the last day of 1981 
in what became Rawlings’s second 
coming under a new junta name, 
the Provisional National Defence 
Council (PNDC). Another junior 

officers’ coup ended Ghana’s short-
lived Third Republic.

The PNDC ruled Ghana with 
an iron fist up to 1992, when the 
Fourth Republic got underway 
with Rawlings transitioning to 
an elected, civilian president. He 
stepped down in 2000 after serving 
two elective terms. During the first 
three years of PNDC rule, between 
1982 and 1985, there were at least 
five attempted coups!

Junior officers overthrowing not 
just civilian governments but the 
entire political establishment, in-
cluding the extant military hierar-
chy, became somewhat of a modal 
trend across West Africa—in Li-
beria, Upper Volta (Burkina Faso) 
and most infamously in Sierra Le-
one, where, in 1992 Captain Val-
entine Strasser became the world’s 
youngest head of state, aged 25, 
perhaps clueless about what to do 
with the power and responsibility 
that came with that position! Inter-
estingly, decades later, Strasser’s 
then colleague and deputy who 
overthrew the young head of state, 
Julius Maada Bio, came to power 
through an election in April 2018 
and was re-elected in June 2023.

At any rate, the painful experi-
ence of numerous coups and failed 
coups in Ghana, especially at the 
end of the 1970s and early 1980s, 
appears to have entrenched an 
anti-coup norm that has held firm 
among Ghanaians. Today, Ghana 
runs on a precarious quasi-liberal 
democratic system characterised by 
citizens’ disillusionment with the 
failed promises of democracy, elite 
corruption and alternation of power 
between two parties with little so-
cioeconomic transformation. But 
to the average Ghanaian civilian, 
and in the armed forces, a military 
takeover is unlikely to be viewed as 
a necessary remedy. As Humphrey 
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Agyekum argues in a recent mono-
graph, Ghana’s armed forces trans-
formed from orchestrators of coups 
to defenders of a civilian political 
settlement (Agyekum 2019).

The Poisoned Chalice

In many African countries, nearly 
every successful coup receives a 
rapturous public celebration from 
citizens desperate for better gov-
ernment and accountable leader-
ship. But careful assessment shows 
that coups have hurt more than 
they have helped Africa’s quest for 
better government and accountable 
leadership. The record of military 
rulers and militarism is deeply ap-
palling. Throughout Africa’s post-
independence period, military 
rulers have been as bad if not al-
together more atrocious than when 
civilians have been in charge. It is 
hard to argue that when civilian 
leadership fails, coups are a solu-
tion—for beyond opening up op-
portunities for a few armed forces 
elites to snatch state power, coups 
are mendacious solutions to civil-
ian governance failures.

In the main, then, the coup d’état, 
while enticing and clutched onto 
by those clamouring for change, 
mostly has been a poisoned chal-
ice. In the end, coups have been 
little more than power grabs by 
self-seeking military actors and op-
portunistic civilian allies. Individu-
als and groups who seize power in 
such a conspiratorial manner are 
hardly different from those who 
rig elections at the behest of either 
uniformed personnel or civilian-
cloaked military actors.

There are very few African coun-
tries that one can point to where the 
military has not had an oversized 
role or where military actors are 
not active players, even when the 
top leadership is civilian. That is, 
whether or not whoever is at the 

top is draped in military fatigues 
or dons a business suit, the armed 
forces have been prominent, in fact 
the most consequential, actors in 
the politics of most postindepen-
dent African states. And the over-
sized role of the military is bereft of 
positive records. Neither in the con-
tainment of public crises nor in the 
governance of state affairs has the 
military’s domination given posi-
tive results that capacitated civilian 
structures would not have achieved 
(Khisa and Rwengabo 2023).

Even if the military does not overtly 
overthrow civilian rulers through 
coups, the uniformed personnel and 
their corporate group, nevertheless, 
tend to influence political process-
es indirectly, including determin-
ing election results, aiding dubious 
constitutional amendments like the 
removal of term limits to entrench 
incumbents and committing rights 
violations on behalf of civilian poli-
ticians, among other egregious acts. 
This is the message of a volume 
published in 2022 on civil–military 
relations in Africa, with the subtitle 
‘Beyond the Coup d’état?’ (Khisa 
and Day 2022).

While the book’s subtitle has a 
question mark, in the main the au-
thors’ core argument posits a ne-
cessity to move beyond the focus 
and obsession with the coup d’état 
to the expansive and often less 
obvious but insidious roles of the 
military and militarism in African 
politics. Erosion of civilian control 
in non-coup situations explains the 
weakening of civilian state struc-
tures and the persistent inability 
to avoid coups d’état where armed 
forces deem fit. Beneath and be-
sides the coup, therefore, civilian 
power and control eludes most                     
of Africa.

Coups are dramatic and make for sa-
lacious media reporting and scream-
ing headlines. But they seldom tell 

us the full story of the role of the 
armed forces in African politics and 
society. The above-mentioned book 
argues that coups had been such a 
common phenomenon for most of 
the first decades of postindepen-
dence Africa but that, since from 
about the mid-2000s they had been 
on the decline, it was somewhat 
sterile to remain fixated on them.

In fact, even with the recent recru-
descence that has caused so much 
animation and online chatter, taken 
decade by decade there were fewer 
coups in Africa in the 2010s than 
previous decades. And it is too 
early to say if the 2020s will nec-
essarily give us more coups than, 
say, the 1990s or 1980s. Quite 
obviously, the recent wave across 
the Sahel and the Lake Chad Ba-
sin is alarming and an indictment 
on the African Union’s (AU) tep-
idness. Despite the apparent anti-
coup norm, the AU has hardly been 
able to rescind coups. In the larger 
scheme of things, though, the coup 
recrudescence is symptomatic of 
the never-ending crisis of ‘gover-
nance’ on the African continent.

Concluding Reflections

In momentous circumstances and 
desperation for change, and in 
the heat of triumphalism, there is 
often a rush to celebrate military 
coups. But such celebrations be-
tray a lack of historical context and 
a proper grasp of Africa’s post-in-
dependence political crises. Coups 
have scarcely been solutions to the 
problems Africa faces. If anything, 
they tend to exacerbate (and not 
mitigate) security challenges and 
sociopolitical instability.

Take one example—Burkina Faso. 
Jihadist insurgency and attacks 
against civilians worsened follow-
ing two successive coups in 2022, 
the first of which was against a ci-
vilian, elected president who was 
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Notes 
1.  https://content.time.com/time/cov-

ers/0,16641,19840116,00.html 
2.  There is undoubtedly a problem 

with defining what a successful 
coup is and is not.

faulted for leadership failures in 
securing the country (Africa Center 
2023). The situation hardly differs 
in Mali and Niger, where military 
juntas overthrew civilian govern-
ments in the face of deteriorating 
security situations. But the coup-
makers, too, have demonstrated an 
appalling failure to improve the se-
curity situations in those countries. 
On the whole, military coups d’état 
have tended to weaken rather than 
strengthen state systems.

Some analysts may point their fin-
ger at external factors in the recru-
descence of coups d’état in Africa. 
But that raises the question of the 
agency of African armed forces and 
political leaders: Why should the 
African continent remain a theatre 
of external intrusion? Worse still, 
any sensible African military and 
security officer, as well as politi-
cian, would know that coups under-
mine rather than enhance struggles 
and prospects for popular demo-
cratic government. Even though 
coup-makers justify their actions 
in the rhetoric of democracy, their 
record of brutality and aversion to 
democracy are clear. Coup-culture 
and military praetorian behaviour 
have done more to contribute to en-
trenching militarism and the ethos 
of the gun than to empower civil 
society and promote accountable 
civilian authority.

References

Africa Center for Strategic Studies, 
2023, Burkina Faso Crisis Contin-
ues to Spiral, 29 August. https://
africacenter.org/spotlight/burki-
na-faso-crisis-continues-to-spiral/

Agyekum, H.A., 2019, From Bullies 
to Officers and Gentlemen: How 
Notions of Professionalism and 
Civility Transformed the Ghana 
Armed Forces, New York and 
London: Berghahn Books.

Chin, J.J. and Kirkpatrick, J., 2023, Af-
rican Coups in the COVID-19 era: 
A Current History, Frontiers in 
Political Science, Vol. 5, pp. 1–20. 
DOI 10.3389/fpos.2023.1077945

Hutchful, E. and Bathily, A., eds, 
1998, The military and militarism 
in Africa, Dakar: CODESRIA.

Khisa, M. and Day, C., eds, 2022, 
Rethinking Civil-military Rela-
tions in Africa: Beyond the Coup 
d’État, Boulder, OH: Lynne Ri-
enner Publishers.

Khisa, M. and Rwengabo, S., 2023, Mil-
itarism and the Politics of Covid-19 
Response in Uganda, Armed Forces 
& Society, Online First. https://doi. 
o r g / 1 0 . 1 1 7 7 / 0 0 9 5 3 2 7 X 
231162848.

Maclean, R., 2023, ‘Five African Coun-
tries. Six Coups. Why Now?’ 
The New York Times, 31 January. 
https://www.nytimes.com/article/
burkina-faso-africa-coup.html. Ac-
cessed 13 October 2023.

Nugent, P., 1995, Big Men, Small Boys 
and Politics in Ghana. Power, 
Ideology and the Burden of His-
tory, 1982–1994. London-New 
York: Pinter.

Reid, R.R., 2012, Warfare in African 
History, New York: Cambridge 
University Press.

Rwengabo, R., 2013, Regime Stability 
in Post-1986 Uganda: Counting 
the Benefits of Coup Proofing, 
Armed Forces & Society, Vol. 39, 
No. 3, pp. 531–559.

Souaré, I.K., 2014, The African Union 
as a Norm Entrepreneur on Mili-
tary Coups d’État in Africa (1952–
2012): An Empirical Assessment, 
The Journal of Modern African 
Studies, Vol. 52, No. 1, pp. 69–94.

The Economist, 2023, ‘Where will 
the next coup be in Africa?’ The 
Economist, 9 October. https://
www.economist.com/graphic-de-
tail/2023/10/09/where-will-the-
next-coup-be-in-africa. Accessed 
14 October 2023.


